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Legal Notice

The Hansen Museum
Continuing Education Pro-
gram is delighted to wel-
come certified Bob Ross
instructor Hope Blakely of
Arvada, Colorado, for two
Magic of Painting classes
on June 21 and 22. On Sat-
urday, participants will cre-
ate a Wilson
Bickford-inspired painting
titled Night Ride, while
Sunday’s session will focus
on the Marion Dutton-in-
spired piece Lilacs. Both
classes will take place in the
Hansen Museum Commu-
nity Room, located at 110
W. Main Street in Logan,
Kansas, from 9:00 a.m. to
3:00 p.m. each day, with a
one-hour lunch break.

These classes offer a
fun, beginner-friendly in-
troduction to painting. Stu-
dents will be guided
step-by-step through the
process of completing a fin-
ished painting each day. No
prior experience is neces-
sary, and all supplies are
provided. Participants need
only bring a roll of paper
towels. Open to individuals
aged 13 and older, these
sessions provide a relaxed,
supportive atmosphere that

fosters creativity and cama-
raderie.

Registration is available
online at
hansenmuseum.org under
the “Classes & Workshops”
section. Discounts are of-
fered to Patron and Sustain-
ing Members of the Hansen
Museum. These classes are
part of the Hansen Museum
Continuing Education Pro-
gram and are made possible
through generous support
from the Dane G. Hansen
Foundation. For more in-
formation, call 785-689-
4846.

The Hansen Museum is
open Monday through Fri-
day from 9:00 to 12:00 and

1:00 to 4:00, Saturdays
from 9:00 to 12:00 and 1:00
to 5:00, and Sundays and
holidays from 1:00 to 5:00. 

Hansen Museum announces be-
ginner friendly painting class

Saturday: Night Ride

Sunday: Lilacs
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More details at www.downschamber.com

2025 DOWNS ANNUAL CELEBRATION •• DOWNS, KANSAS
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Tomatoes are the most
popular vegetable grown in
Kansas. Nothing beats the
fresh taste of a homegrown
tomato picked straight from
the garden. They are easy
to grow, productive in
small garden areas, and
used in a wide variety of
ways. Tomatoes require a
location that is fairly fertile,
well-drained, and sunny,
getting at least half a day of
sun or more. By this time
of year, most of us have
tomatoes setting and will
soon be ripening. Here are
some tips on how to keep
your plants healthy and
some problems you may
encounter during the grow-
ing season. 

Spider mites seem to be
a problem every year. It is
inevitable that with hot and
dry weather, spider mites
will make an appearance.
Look for stippling on the
upper surface of the leaves
as well as some fine web-
bing on the underside of the
leaves. These tiny arthro-
pods (they are not true in-
sects) are often difficult to
see due to their size and
their habit of feeding on the
underside of leaves. If you
think you have spider
mites, hold a white piece of
paper under the leaves and
gently tap the plant. Mites
will be dislodged and can
be seen as tiny specks on
the paper that move about. 

Spider mite control can
be challenging. A strong jet
of water can be used to re-
move the mites, but it may
not be as easy as it sounds.
A high-pressure directed
spray is needed to dislodge
the mites. Since spider
mites feed on the underside
of the leaves, the spray is
most effective if it comes
from below. This can be
difficult to accomplish with
a thumb over the end of the
hose. 

Some gardeners use a
water wand hooked to a
shut-off valve. The water
breaker is then replaced by
a brass nozzle. Horticul-
tural oils and insecticidal
soaps (Safers, for example)
can also be helpful. Spray
early in the morning when

temperatures are cooler and
plants have rehydrated. You
will likely need to treat
more than once. 

Something we often see
in Kansas, during hot sum-
mer weather, is that our
tomatoes are not setting
fruit. Temperatures that re-
main above 75°F at night
and day temperatures
above 95° F with dry, hot
winds will cause poor fruit
set on tomatoes. In extreme
summer heat, blossom drop
is common. At tempera-
tures above 90°F and with
low humidity, poor pollina-
tion causes blossom drop
and poor fruit set. It usually
takes about 3 weeks for
tomato flowers to develop
into fruit large enough to
notice that something is
wrong and an additional
week before tomatoes are
full size and ready to start
ripening. 

Though there are "heat-
set" tomatoes such as
Florida 91, Sun Leaper and
Sun Master that will set
fruit at higher tempera-
tures, that difference is nor-
mally only 2 to 3 degrees.
There really isn’t a quick
cure for this tomato prob-
lem, we must wait for
cooler temperatures which
will allow tomatoes to re-
sume fruit set.  

This time of year, two
common leaf-spot diseases
appear on tomato plants.
Septoria leaf spot and early
blight, both show up as
brown spots on the leaves.
Septoria leaf spot usually
appears earlier in the sea-
son than early blight and
produces small dark spots.
Spots made by early blight
are much larger and often
have a distorted “target”
pattern of concentric cir-
cles. Heavily infected
leaves eventually turn yel-
low and drop. Older leaves
are more susceptible than
younger ones, so these dis-
eases often start at the bot-
tom of the plant and work
up. 

Mulching, caging, or
staking keeps plants off the
ground, making them less
vulnerable. Better air circu-
lation allows foliage to dry

quicker than in plants al-
lowed to sprawl. Mulching
also helps prevent water
from splashing and carry-
ing disease spores to the
plant. 

In situations where these
diseases have been a prob-
lem in the past, rotation is a
good strategy. It is too late
for that now, but keep it in
mind for next year. If rota-
tion is not feasible, fungi-
cides are often helpful. Be
sure to cover both upper
and lower leaf surfaces,
and reapply fungicide if
rainfall removes it. 

Plants usually become
susceptible when the
tomato fruit is about the
size of a walnut.
Chlorothalonil is a good
choice for fruiting plants
because it has a 0-day wait-
ing period, meaning that
fruit can be harvested once
the spray is dry.
Chlorothalonil can be
found in numerous prod-
ucts including Fertilome
Broad-Spectrum Land-
scape and Garden Fungi-
cide, Ortho Garden Disease
Control, GardenTech Da-
conil and others. Be sure to
start protecting plants when
the disease is first seen. It is
virtually impossible to con-
trol this disease on heavily
infected plants. If
chlorothalonil doesn’t seem
to be effective, try man-
cozeb (Bonide Mancozeb
Flowable). Mancozeb does
have a five-day waiting pe-
riod between application
and when the fruit can be
harvested. You may wish to
pick some tomatoes green
just before you spray if you
use Mancozeb and let the
tomato fruit ripen inside.

If you have trouble with
your tomatoes this season,
call your local extension
office for more resources. 

Post Rock Extension
District of K-State Re-
search and Extension
serves Jewell, Lincoln,
Mitchell, Osborne, and
Smith counties. Cassie may
be contacted at
cthiessen@ksu.edu or by
calling Beloit (785-738-
3597). Find us online at
www.postrock.ksu.edu

Growing Perfect Tomatoes 

Post Rock Extension District

Cassie Thiessen 

Horticulture Extension Agent

Sunday June 8, 2025,
Pentecost Sunday, Steve
Richardson played "Every
time I Hear the Spirit" for
our special. 

Pastor Ian's message was
from Judges 4: Deborah:
Judge, Prophet,
Leader....But here's the
onion. 

After 20 years of oppres-
sion the Israelites cry out for
God to help them. The first
onion layer is peeled: Sisera
has 900 iron chariots and a
dominating army, so Barak

goes to Deborah for help.
She tells him get 10,000
men and go fight but he
won't unless she goes too! 

She tells him the Lord
will sell Sisera into the
hands of a woman. So they
go and the Lord delivers
Sisera into their hands. Sis-
era runs away and hides in a
tent that is Jael. He asked
her to hide him which she
does but while he sleeps she
pounds a tent stake into his
temple.

Another layer of the

onion peeled! Obedience
doesn't always look playing
safe but looks like stepping
where others won't. Bod
chooses the foolish things of
the world to shame the wise,
He chose the weak things of
the world to shame the
strong. 

Jesus was not with ham-
mer in His hand, but with
nails driven through them.
The cross is our tent peg.
Live out the lesson of the
onion, be available, use
what you have and be bold.

Cawker City Methodist Church


